
Finance in Common Summit 2022: other events 

Title Organizer Format Date/time Place Description 

Meeting of Chief 
Economists of 
Development 

Financial 
Institutions of 
Latin America 

and the 
Caribbean ; 

Rethinking the 
productive 

matrix of Latin 
America and the 

Caribbean for 
the world to 

come 

ALIDE 
In person 
(open to 

all) 

22-sept 
from 8:00 

– 13:30 PM 

Sala 
Multipropósito, 

Banco BICE, 
Bartolomé 
Mitre 836, 

Buenos Aires, 
Argentina 

Taking the results of the 
first day's discussions 

between chief 
economists and 

presidents, day two 
discussed development 

financing challenges. 

The role of 
education, skills 
and training in 

making the 
ecological 
transition 

socially just 

FICS 
Coalition for 

Social 
Investment 

Online 
4-oct from 

13:30 – 
14:45 PM    

Online webinar 

Organized by AFD and 
CEB, the event discussed 
the role of education for 
a socially just ecological 
transition, agreeing on 
the need to reinvest in 

education as a 
continuum of solutions 

from basic to higher, 
general to technical and 
vocational education, as 
well as employment and 

entrepreneurship. 

Domestic 
resource 

mobilisation as 
a lever for 

growth and 
sustainable 

development: 
the role of 

National and 
Regional 
Financial 

Institutions in 
Africa 

Caisse des 
dépôts  

In person 
(by 

invitation 
only) 

18-oct 
from 

14:30 – 
16:00 PM 

Sofitel Abidjan 

This side meeting 
highlighted and 

compared the "Caisse 
des Dépôts" model and 

the Provident Fund 
model with development 
banks and other actors 
in the financial system 
(Event in French only). 



From FICS to 
COP15 : the key 
contribution of 

PDBs to 
biodiversity 

WWF, COP 
15, IDFC 

Hybrid 
18 oct 

from 15:30 
to 17:00 

Sofitel Abidjan 

This side event 
presented two 

methodologies (WWF 
and IDFC) on integrating 

biodiversity concerns 
into the strategies and 

operations of 
development finance 

institutions. 

Joining forces: 
growing impact 

in Africa & 
beyond 

GSG  
In person 
(open to 

all) 

18-oct 
from 9:00 

– 16:45 PM 

Noom Hotel 
Abidjan 

Success stories and 
examples across 

industries on how the 
public and private sector 
can leverage each other 

to mobilise private 
capital for public good 
while addressing the 

barriers facing inclusive 
growth were presented. 

FICS Executive 
Committee 

FICS 

In person 
(by 

invitation 
only) 

18-oct 
from 17:15 
– 18:45 PM 

Sofitel Abidjan 

For the first time in 
person, the meeting 

gathered key senior FICS 
members to guide the 

future work and 
orientations of the 

initiative.   

Informal 
meeting on 

PDBs Technical 
assistance : 

state of play and 
opportunities 

FICS In person  
19-oct at 
16:00 – 
16:45 

Sofitel Abidjan 

This event allowed 
participants to share 

views on current 
technical assistance 
efforts and needs to 
align with the SDG. 

Role of PDBs to 
help tackle 

growing food 
insecurity, 

identifying best 
practices and 

blended finance 
pipelines for 

upscaling 
investment in 

sustainable food 
systems 

ECDPM-IFAD-
CDP 

In person 
19-oct at 
18:00 – 
19:00 

Sofitel Abidjan 

The event discussed 
PDBs' commitment to 
enhancing synergies 

with private financiers 
and their networks, such 

as the Good Food 
Finance Network (GFFN). 

Beyond identifying 
bankable deals, it 

recommended adopting 
integrated and 
comprehensive 

approaches to financing 
inclusive and resilient 

SFS, strengthening local 



stakeholder initiatives 
and ecosystems. 

Women CEO 
Breakfast 

FICS Gender 
Coalition 

In person 
(by 

invitation 
only) 

20-oct at 
7:15 AM 

Sofitel Abidjan 

 The breakfast took 
stock of achievements 

made by the FICS 
Gender Coalition and 
discuss the existing 

barriers preventing the 
realization of gender 

equality and women’s 
empowerment. 

WFDFI Board of 
Governors 

Meeting 
 

ALIDE 

In person 
(by 

invitation 
only) 

21-oct 
from 10:00 
– 12:00 PM 

Sofitel Abidjan 

The event discussed 
recent and future 

matters pertaining to the 
group. 

 

Seminar AFD- 
l’Assemblée 

parlementaire de 
la Francophonie  

AFD-
l’Assemblée 

parlementaire 
de la 

Francophonie 

In person 21-oct 

Agence 
Française de 

développement 
Abidjan 

The seminar for 
parliamentarians from 8 

countries in the Sahel 
region provided training 
on security and climate 

change. 

Finance your 
Cities 

FMDV 
In person 
(open to 

all) 

21-oct 
from 8:00 

– 17:30 PM 
Sofitel Abidjan 

The one-day conference 
brought together high-
level national, regional 

and local public leaders 
with key players in public 
and private finance and 

investment. 

 


